Salt Bid option to extend 1 of 2: Yes, till 08-31-2025
Salt Bid option to extend 2 of 2: Yes, till 08-31-2026

Bids opened August 18, 2023 Contract period - 9/1/2023 - 8/31/2024
Name of Bidder American Rock Salt Co. Compass Minerals America Inc.  Cargill Morton Salt
P.O. Box 190 9900 W. 109th Street 24950 Country Club Bivd 444 West Lake Street
Mount Morris, NY 14510 Overland Park, KS 66210 North Olmsted, OH 44070 Chicago, IL 60606
1-888-762-7258 1-800-323-1641 1-800-600-7258 1-312-807-2000
Towns
Attica 57.15 no bid no bid no bid
Bennington 57.15 no bid no bid no bid
Castile 5715 no bid no bid no bid
Covington 57.15 no bid no bid no bid
Eagle 57.15 no bid no bid no bid
Gainesville 57.15 no bid no bid no bid
Genesee Falls 57.15 no bid no bid no bid
Java 57.15 no bid no bid no bid
Middlebury 57.15 no bid no bid no bid
Orangeville 5715 no bid no bid no bid
Pike 57.15 no bid no bid no bid
Sheldon 5715 no bid no bid no bid
Warsaw 57.15 no bid no bid no bid
Wethersfield 57.15 no bid no bid no bid
Wyo Cnty Highway 57.15 no bid no bid no bid
WCCH 57.15 no bid no bid no bid
Village of Arcade 57.15 no bid no bid no bid
Village of Attica 57.15 no bid no bid no bid
Village of Castile 57.15 no bid no bid no bid
Village of Perry 57.15 no bid no bid no bid
Village of Warsaw 57.15 no bid no bid no bid
Devin Blue

winning bidder: American Rock Salt County Superintendent of Highways
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