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Rock Glen, New York

Stone Fill (FOB QUARRY)

Bids opened March 12, 2025 Contract period - 4/02/2025- 4/1/2026
Name of Bidder Name of Bidder Name of Bidder
County Line Stone Co., Inc. Dolomite Products Company Heidelberg Materials Northeast - NY LLC
4515 Crittenden Road 7610 County Route 65 6895 Ellicott Street
P.O. Box 150 Hornell, NY 14843 Pavilion, New York 14525
Akron, New York 14001 Phone: 607-324-3636 Phone 584-3132
Phone: 716-542-5435 Quarry : 8250 Gulf Rd LeRoy NY 14482 |Quarry : NYS Route 5 Safford, NY
Item 620.02-Fine
Price per Ton 20.00 24.00 28.00
2024 18.00 20.50 26.00

item 620.03 - Light
Price per Ton 21.00 27.00 28.00
[ 2024 22.00 25.000 26.00

Item 620.04 - Medium

Price per Ton 45.00 36.00 42.00

2024] 44.00 No Bid [ 40.00
Item 620.05 - Heavy
Price per Ton 45.00 50.00 72.00

2024] 44.00 No Bid [ 70.00
Item 620.05E - Rip Rap
Price per Ton 85.00 No Bid No Bid

2024] 80.00 No Bid [ No Bid

2025 Bid Winners 2024 Bid Winners

Item # 620.02 - Fine is awarded to County Line Stone County Line Stone
ltem # 620.03 - Light is awarded to County Line Stone County Line Stone
Item # 620.04 - Medium is awarded to Dolomite Products Co. Heidelberg Materials Northeast - NY LLC
ltem # 620.05 - Heavy is awarded to County Line Stone County Line Stone
Item # 620.05E - Rip Rap awarded to County Line Stone County Line Stone

** Ties go to closer plant

Devin Blue
County Superintendent of Highways



