Bids opened March 12, 2025

Wyoming County Department of Highways
Rock Glen, New York

Liquid Bituminous Materials

Name of Bidder Name of Bidder

Contract Period - 4/02/25 - 11/15/25

Name of Bidder

D & H Excavating Inc.
11939 Route 98 S.
Arcade, NY 14009

13519 West Lee Rd
Albion, NY 14411

(718) 492-4956 (585) 589-4481

Keeler Construction Co., Inc

Midland Asphalt Materials, Inc.
640 Young Street
P.O. Box 388
Tonawanda, NY 14151-0388
(716) 692-0730

NYS DOT ltem No.
Asphalt Emulsions

Price/gallon
Application
Surface Treatment

Price/galion
Application
Surface Treatment

Price/galion
Application
Surface Treatment

702-3102 HFRS-2 P
(polymer modified 2% min)

N/B N/B

3.933

| 2024 ~/B]

/8]

3.934]

702-3301 HFMS-28T

N/B N/B

3.663

| 2024 N/B]

N/B]

3.664 |

702-44101 CRS-2

N/B N/B

3.643

[

| 2024 N/BJ

N/B]

3.644 |

702-4702 CRS-2P

N/B N/B

3.913

| 2024 g

nig]

3914 |

407-0102 Diluted Tack Coat
total price per hour to include Distributor and Operator’

575
198.00

6.50
200.00

6.911
250.00

407-0103 Straight Tack Coat
total price per hour to include Distributor and Operator’

6.25
198.00

7.00
200.00

7.411
250.00




Bids opened March 12, 2025

Wyoming County Department of Highways
Rock Gien, New York

Liquid Bituminous Materials

Name of Bidder

Name of Bidder

Contract Period - 4/02/25 - 11/15/25

Name of Bidder

Spallina Materials, Inc.
P.0. Box 89
West Bloomfield, NY

(585) 657-6575

Suit-Kote Corporation
1911 Lorings Crossing Road
Cortland, NY 13045

(607) 763-1100

NYS DOT Item No.
Asphalt Emulsions

Price/galion
Application
Surface Treatment

Price/gallon
Application
Surface Treatment

Price/galion
Application
Surface Treatment

702-3102 HFRS-2 P

(polymer modified 2% min) N/B 3.913

2024 N/B] 3.914] [
702-3301 HFMS-2ST N/B 3.558
[ 2024 N/g| 3.644] [
702-44101 CRS-2 N/B 3.663
[ 2024 VR 3.664] [
702-4702 CRS-2P N/B 3.933

2024 nrg] 3.934] [
407-0102 Diluted Tack Coat 6.00 6.911
total price per hour to include Distributor and Operator' 160.00 250.00
407-0103 Straight Tack Coat 6.75 7.411
total price per hour to include Distributor and Operator’ 160.00 250.00

Prices will have an adjustment for asphalt costs.

ltem No. 702-3102 HFRS-2 is awarded to
Item No. 702-3301 HFMS-2ST is awarded to
ltem No. 702-4101 CRS-2 is awarded to

ltem No. 702-4702 CRS-2P is awarded to

** Ties awarded by Lot

Suit-Kote
Suit-Kote
Midland Asphalt

Midland Asphalt

Devin Blue
County Superintendent of Highways




Wyoming County Department of Highways
Rock Glen, New York 14550

LIQUID BITUMINOUS MATERIAL - EQUIPMENT RENTAL & LOBOR

Bids opened March 12, 2025 Contract Period 4/02/25 - 4/01/26
: Ven-dor Ven_dor
Midiand Asphalt Corporation Suit-Kote
640 Young Street 1911 Lorings Crossing Rd.
P.O. Box 388 Cortland, NY 13045
Tonawanda, New York 14151 Phone: 607-753-1100

Phone: 716-692-0730
Fax:. 716-692-0613

Liquid Bituminous Material - AEPM
Provide delivery and application of liquid bitumionous material(s) at the job site(s)

Emulsion with Distributor 2.342 | Gal 2.342 /Gal

Equipment Rental & Labor B $ Per Gallons / $ per Day Per Gallons / $ per Day
Mechanized Chip Spreader $0.30/gls / $3,000.00 No Bid / $3,000.00
Tandem Steel Roller: 10-12 ton No Bid No Bid / $2,600.00
Rubber Tire Roller: 10-12 ton $0.24 gls. / $2,400.00 No Bid / $2,400.00
Vibratory Roller - minimum 66" double drum No Bid / $2,600.00
Vibratory Pad Foot Roller - 15 ton No Bid No Bid / $3,100.00
Tandem Axe! Dump Truck No Bid No Bid
Rubber Tire Loader:minimum 2 cy bucket No Bid NoBid / $2,500.00
Paver includes operator and screen man No Bid NoBid / $3,700.00
Pugmill Minimum 5000 -gallon usage;
incluces operator $0.32gls / $3,200.00 No Bid / $3,200.00
Mix Pave minimum 5000 gallons usage;
includes operator and screen man $0.33gls /  $3,300.00 No Bid
Mix Pave for liquid asphalt cement foamed
application; includes operator and screen man No Bid No Bid
Shoulder Widner No Bid No Bid
Price to optionally provide all trucking No Bid No Bid
Nuclear Density Gauge and technician No Bid No Bid
Laborer / Flagger No Bid $ 150.00 per Hour

Devin Blue

County Superintendent of Highways



Wyoming County Department of Highways
Rock Glen, New York 14550

LIQUID BITUMINOUS MATERIAL - EQUIPMENT RENTAL & LOBOR

Contract Period 4/02/25 - 4/01/26 Contract Period 4/02/25 - 4/01/26 Contract Period 4/02/25 - 4/01/26
Ven-dor Ven-dor Ven-dor
Spallina Materials Inc. Keeler Construction Co. Inc. D & H Excavating Inc.

PO BOX 89 13519 W. Lee Rd 11939 State Route 98
West Bloomfield, NY 14585 Albion,NY 14411 Arcade, NY 14009
585-657-6575 585-589-4481 716-492-4956
No Bid No Bid No Bid
Per Gallons / $ per Day Per Gallons / $ per Day Per Gallons / $ per Day
No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid



MICRO-SURFACING BID

Bids opened March 12, 2025

Wyoming County Department of Highways

Rock Glen, New York 14550

Contract Period 4/02/25 - 11/15/25

Vendor Vendor
Midland Asphalt Corporation Suit-Kote
640 Young Street 1911 Lorings Crossing Rd.
P.O. Box 388 Cortland, NY 13045

Tonawanda, New York 14151
Phone: 716-692-0730
Fax. 716-692-0613

Phone: 607-753-1100

QUANTITIES:

Quantities to be placed under 100 tons . No Bid $408.00
Quantities to be placed under 101 - 300 tons i No Bid $243.00
Quantities to be placed under 301 - 500 tons No Bid $225.00

Quantities to be placed over 500 tons No Bid $215.00

Contract is awarded to Suit-Kote, the only bidder.

Devin Blue
County Superintendent of Highways



