WYOMING COUNTY HIGHWAY DEPARTMENT
ASPHALTIC CONCRETE

Materials, Delivery & Rented Equipment/Labor
Bidder's List

X County Line Stone Co., Inc
4515 Crittenden Road, PO Box 150
Akron, NY 14001
716-542-5435

X D & H Excavating Inc
11939 State Route 98
Arcade, NY 14009
716-492-4956

X Gernatt Asphalt Products, Inc.
13870 Taylor Hollow Road
Collins, NY 14034
716-532-3371

X Heidelberg Materials Northeast - NY LLC
6895 Ellicott Street
Pavilion, NY 14525
585-584-3132

X Hojnowski Transport
1042 French Rd
Attica, NY 14011
585-591-0844

X Keeler Construction
13519 West Lee Rd
Albion, NY 14411
585-589-4481

X Spallina Materials, Inc.
PO Box 89
West Bloomfield, NY 14585
585-657-8001



WYOMING COUNTY HIGHWAY DEPARTMENT

Bids Opened: 3/12/2025

ASPHALTIC CONCRETE

Price/Ton F.O.B. Plant
O

Contract Period : 04/1/25 - 11/15/25
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Ashalt Pavement Material @ 8 8 3 T &
Iltem No Description
402.0383 Miscellaneous Patching F3 8% 65.00 77.25 78.25 69.00 72.00
402.0589 Shim Course F9 9.25% 83.00 88.50 89.75 80.50 83.00
402.0682 6.3 F2 Top Course 7.70% 78.00 88.25 89.50 71.00 78.00
402.0982 9.5 F2 Top Course 7.20% 71.00 81.00 82.25 69.00 72.00
402.1282 12.5 F2 Top Course 6.50% 69.00 78.00 79.25 66.50 69.50
402.1989 19.0 F9 Binder Course 59 64.00 67.00 68.25 61.75 64.00
402.2589 25.0 F9 Binder Course 6% 62.00 67.50 68.75 60.00 63.50
402.3789 37.5 F9 Base Course 6.50% 62.00 64.75 66.00 59.00 62.75
Polymer Polymer Modification to 64V-22AC 4.00 3.75 3.75 4.00 4.50
404 Warm Mix |warm Mix Asphalt to NYSDOT 404 spec 2.00 1.75 1.75 4.00 2.00
Large Job Deduction|Dedution for specific job/project over 2000 tons 4.00 2.00 0.00 2.00 2.50
Transportation / Hauling Delivery Rate For Asphalt Items
First -to- 6 Miles 6.00 570 5.70 7.50 5.50
6.1 - 15 Miles 0.30 0.40 0.40 1.00 0.35
OVER 15.1 Miles 0.30 0.35 0.35 0.50 0.35
COLD PATCH MATERIAL
ltem No Description
15402.201 Regular Mix MAC V 7.00% 110.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
15402.203 Modified Mix UPM 7.00% 135.00 No Bid 114.00 No Bid No Bid
15402.204 Fiber Reinforced Mix 7.00% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid




WYOMING COUNTY HIGHWAY DEPARTMENT
ASPHALTIC CONCRETE
RENTED EQUIPMENT/LABOR
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Bid Opened 3/12/2025 Bidder 3 8 ] ]
Rented Equipment/Labor
Daily Rate (8 hrs OT Rate/hr for Daily Rate (8 hrs OT Rate/hr for
Equipment Labor Included excluding mobilization) work over 8 hours excluding mobilization) work over 8 hours
10'-20' Asphalt Paver |Operator and Screed Man 4 100.00 550.00 3,800.00 450.00
7' wide Vibratory
Steel Drum Roller Operator 2,200.00 300.00 2,000.00 225.00
Laborer (Paving/M&PT) 1,100.00 165.00 950.00 125.00
Foreman 1,200.00 185.00 1,050.00 145.00
Skid Steer w/bucket
Mill Head Attachment Operator 1,600.00 225.00 1,500.00 200.00
Water Truck Driver/Laborer 1,300.00 200.00 1,100.00 140.00
M&PT Supplies and
Service Truck Flaggers (2 each) 2,500.00 350.00 2,300.00 265.00
Mobilization Lowboy truck and Operator 200.00 185.00
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WYOMING COUNTY HIGHWAY DEPARTMENT
ASPHALTIC CONCRETE
RENTED EQUIPMENT/LABOR
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Bid Opened 3/12/2025 Bidder 8 3 £ L
Rented Equipment/Labor
Daily Rate (8 hrs OT Rate/hr for Daily Rate (8 hrs OT Rate/hr for
Equipment Labor Included excluding mobilization) work over 8 hours excluding mobilization) work over 8 hours
10'-20' Asphalt Paver |Operator and Screed Man No Bid No Bid 5,000.00 500.00
7' wide Vibratory
Steel Drum Roller Operator No Bid No Bid 3,000.00 300.00
Laborer (Paving/M&PT) No Bid No Bid 1,500.00 150.00
Foreman No Bid No Bid 1,500.00 150.00
Skid Steer w/bucket
Mill Head Attachment Operator No Bid No Bid 2,200.00 220.00
Water Truck Driver/Laborer No Bid No Bid 1,500.00 150.00
M&PT Supplies and
Service Truck Flaggers (2 each) No Bid No Bid 3,000.00 300.00
Mobilization of Eqgp.
Lowboy truck and Operator No Bid 200.00
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WYOMING COUNTY HIGHWAY DEPARTMENT
ASPHALTIC CONCRETE
RENTED EQUIPMENT/LABOR
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Bid Opened 3/12/2025 Bidder 2 N & &
Rented Equipment/Labor
Daily Rate (8 hrs OT Rate/hr for Daily Rate (8 hrs OT Rate/hr for
Equipment Labor Included excluding mobilization) work over 8 hours excluding mobilization) work over 8 hours
10-20' Asphalt Paver |Operator and Screed Man 4,100.00 400.00 3,900.00 400.00
7' wide Vibratory
Steel Drum Roller Operator 2,400.00 260.00 2,000.00 200.00
Laborer (Paving/M&PT) 1,200.00 120.00 975.00 140.00
Foreman 1,300.00 140.00 1,100.00 150.00
Skid Steer w/bucket
Mill Head Attachment Operator 1,900.00 190.00 1,500.00 175.00
Water Truck Driver/Laborer 1,300.00 120.00 1,200.00 140.00
M&PT Supplies and
Service Truck Flaggers (2 each) 2,600.00 240.00 2,250.00 280.00
Mobilization of Eqp.
Lowboy truck and Operator 185.00 185.00
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3/12/2025

Rented Equipment/Labor

Bidder

Truck Hauling

Company: County Line Stone

Minimun/Maximun Total Travel Time
Equipment Labor Included Capacity (tons) Hourly Rate Allowed per Day
Tandem Axel Driver 0-20 $130.00 1 hour
Tri Axel Driver 0-23 $135.00 1 hour
Truck with Trailer Driver 0-36 $165.00 1 hour
Flowboy/Rock Trailer Driver 0-38 $185.00 Thour
Rented Equipment/Labor
Company: D & H Excavating

Minimun/Maximun Total Travel Time
Equipment Labor Included Capacity (tons) Hourly Rate Allowed per Day
Tandem Axel Driver 0-21 $130.00 1 Hour
Tri Axel Driver 0-22 $140.00 1 Hour
Truck with Trailer Driver 0-37 $190.00 1 Hour
Rented Equipment/Labor
Company: Gernatt Asphalt

Minimun/Maximun Total Travel Time
Equipment Labor Included Capacity (tons) Hourly Rate Allowed per Day
Tandem Axel Driver 0-22 No Bid 1 HOUR
Tri Axel Driver 0-22 $185.00 2 HOUR
Truck with Trailer Driver 0-35 No Bid 1 HOUR
Rented Equipment/Labor
Company: Heidelberg Materials

Minimun/Maximun Total Travel Time
Equipment Labor Included Capacity (tons) Hourly Rate Allowed per Day
Tandem Axel Driver 20-22 $175.00 10 HOUR
Tri Axel Driver 20-22 $175.00 10 HOUR
Truck with Trailer Driver 35-36 $200.00 10 HOUR




Bid Opened 3/12/2025

Rented Equipment/Labor

Bidder

Truck Hauling

Company: Hojnowski Transport

Minimun/Maximun Total Travel Time
Equipment Labor Included Capacity (tons) Hourly Rate Allowed per Day
Tandem Axel Driver 22-23 $125.00 1/2 HOUR
Tri Axel Driver 20-22 No Bid No Bid
Truck with Trailer Driver 28-32 $165.00 1/2 HOUR
|Rented Equipment/l.abor
Company: Keeler Construction

Minimun/Maximun Total Travel Time
Equipment Labor Included Capacity (tons) Hourly Rate Allowed per Day
Tandem Axel Driver 0-20 No Bid No Bid
Tri Axel Driver 0-23 $135.00 1 HOUR
Truck with Trailer Driver 0-35 $195.00 1 HOUR
Rented Equipment/Labor
Company: Spallina

Minimun/Maximun ** Total Travel Time
Equipment Labor Included Capacity (tons) Hourly Rate Allowed per Day **
Tandem Axel Driver 0-20 $165.00 1 HOUR
Tri Axel Driver 0-22 $165.00 1 HOUR
Truck with Trailer Driver 0-35 $190.00 1 HOUR




